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Regulations, Chapter 5.04.060, titled Classes by reclassifying and defining classes of business licenses within
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severability, constitutionality and effective date thereof; and other matters properly relating thereto.
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Amended Version to the
Proposed Version of Nye County
Bill No. 2020-06 Proposed at the

June 16, 2020 BOCC Meeting



BILL NO. 2020-06

NYE COUNTY ORDINANCE NO.

SUMMARY: A Bill proposing to amend Nye
County Code Title 5, titled Business
Licenses and Regulations, Chapter
5.04.060, titled Classes by
rcclassifiing and defining classes of
business licenses.

TITLE: A BILL PROPOSING TO AMEND NYE COUNTY CODE TITLE 5, TITLED
BUSINESS LICENSES AND REGULATIONS, CHAPTER 5.04.060, TITLED
CLASSES BY RECLASSIFYING AND D INING CLASSES OF BUSINESS
LICENSES, AND PROVIDING OR THE SEVERABILITY,
CONSTITUTIONALITY AND EFFEC DATE THEREOF; AND OTHER
MATTERS PROPERLY RELATING THERETO.

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.119, the Nye County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to amend the Nye County Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.350 the Nyc County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to regulate the sale of intoxicating liquors.

A

NOW, THEREFORE, pursuant to NRS 244.110, the Board of County Commissioners
of the County of Nyc, State of Nevada, does ordain:

‘
NYE COUNTY CODE IS HEREBY AMENDED AS FOLLOWS, with Deletions shown in
strike-through, red font, and additions and modifications shown in underscored blue font:

5.04.060: CLASSES: ‘.

The following classes of licenses may be issued to qualified applicants therefor:

A. Packaged liquor license;

B. Retail linnnr liceo;

C. Wholesale do1iver liquor license;

D. Wholesale liiiiinr license;

E. Special club license;
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F. Boer wine only (sold with meals);

G. Special licencs. (Ord. 101 § 6, 1983)

A. Class I, Packaged Liciuor Sales Establishment: Any establishment selling liquor to
individuals in its original corked or unopened package for consumption off premises and
includes convenience-liquor-grocery stores and other similar types tores.

p
B. Class II, Retail Liquor Sales Establishment - Bar: Any establi t selling at retail liquor

by the drink for consumption on premises, and in a bar g, ich may or may not
include a restaurant as an accessory use.

C. Class III S ecial Club Li uor Sales Establishme establishment dis ensin li uor
b the drink for consum tion on remises oni which is estricted in use to members
and guest(s) accompanied by a member.

D. Class IV Li uor manufacturer: An establishmen anufactures li uor for sale to the
public which includes distilleries, w ries, cideries, meaderies and breweries.

F. Class V, Wholesale Dealer: Any ye ji cito sell liquor as it is originally packaged
to retail liquor stores or to another lie d wh ale4

F. Class VI. Special Event Liquor Licens cense which authorizes the licensee to sell,
sei e 01 give away alOholic leyerages consumption only on the premises foI which
the license is issuedd only fo such t specified on the license, but not to exceed
nine (9) consecutive calendar T license which must be appioved by the
DirectorBoard and is limLi&’ yplicant per calendar quarter.

G. Class VII, 72-Hour Spccia1vcnt Permit. a defined in thit Chapter below.Liquor License:
A license for selling liquor

r

1. A Nonprofit Club or Club which otherwise does not hold a liquor license or

2. A currently licensed for profit business or other for profit or nonprofit entity
which desires to sell liquor outside of its licensed premises.

3. This license shall be subject to the following restrictions:
A. Shall not exceed two (2) consecutive calendar months and
B. Shall not exceed two (2) events per calendar month.

SEVERABILITY. If any provision of this ordinance or amendments thereto, or the application
to any person, thing or circumstance is held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the
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validity or provisions or applications of the ordinance or amendments thereto which can be given
effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance
and amendments thereto are declared to be severable.

CONSTITUTIONALITY. If any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance shall be declared
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions of this ordinance
shall continue in full force and effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect and after passage,
approval, and publication as required by law, to wit, from and after the ay ofJu1, 2020.

Proposed on the day of , 2020.

Proposed by: Commissioner

Adopted on the day of , 2020

‘t1’111

VOTE: AYES: NAYS:

ARSFNT

Vote: Ayes: --_Commissioners:

DDr\Drwur 4TccTrTuD

— ,

PASSFF) nn thu day of

_________
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A nnmr’,r’-r’Tnrfl -

ATTEST:

Sandra L. Merlino, County Clerk
and Ex Officio Clerk of the Board

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF THE UN 1T’J CTAT

OF NEVADA

By:

__________

John Koenig, Chair

1_1I L_ 1 L1__ 1 __1

of the year 2020.

— - - - r
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BILL NO. 2020-06

NYE COUNTY ORDINANCE NO.

SUMMARY: A Bill proposing to amend Nye
County Code Title 5, titled Business
Licenses and Regulations, Chapter
5.04.060, titled Classes by
reclassifying and defining classes of
business licenses.

TITLE: A BILL PROPOSING TO AMEND NYE COUNTY CODE TITLE 5, TITLED
BUSINESS LICENSES AND REGULATIONS, CHAPTER 5.04.060, TITLED
CLASSES BY RECLASSIFYING AND DEFINING CLASSES OF BUSINESS
LICENSES, AND PROVIDING FOR THE SEVERABILITY,
CONSTITUTIONALITY AND EFFECTIVE DATE THEREOF; AND OTHER
MATTERS PROPERLY RELATING THERETO.

I
WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.119, the Nye County Board of Commissioners

(Board) is authorized to amend the Nye County Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.350 the Nye County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to regulate the sale of intoxicating liquors.

NOW, THEREFORE, pursuant to NRS 244.110, the Board of County Commissioners
of the County of Nye, State of Nevada, does ordain:

NYE COUNTY CODE IS HEREBY AMENDED AS FOLLOWS, with DeIes shown in
strike-through, red font, and additions and modifications shown in underscored blue font:

I.

5.04.060: CLASSES:

The following classes of licenses maybe issued to qualified applicants therefor:
A. Class I, Packaged Liquor Sales Establishment: Any establishment selling liquor to

individuals in its original corked or unopened package for consumption off premises and
includes convenience-liquor-grocery stores and other similar types of stores.

B. Class II, Retail Liquor Sales Establishment - Bar: Any establishment selling at retail liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises, and in a bar setting, which may or may not
include a restaurant as an accessory use.

C. Class III, Special Club Liquor Sales Establishment: Any establishment dispensing liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises only, and which is restricted in use to members
and guest(s) accompanied by a member.

Nyc County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nye County Code Title 5 AMENDMENTS TO THE PROPOSED DRAFT
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D. Class IV, Liquor manufacturer: Any establishment that manufactures liquor for sale to the
public which includes distilleries, wineries, cideries, meaderies and breweries.

E. Class V, Wholesale Dealer: Any person licensed to sell liquor as it is originally packaged
to retail liquor stores or to another licensed wholesaler.

F. Class VI, Special Event Liquor License: A license which authorizes the licensee to sell,
serve, or give away alcoholic beverages for consumption only on the premises for which
the license is issued and only for such time as specified on the license, but not to exceed
nine (9) consecutive calendar days. This license must be approved by the Board and is
limited to one (1) per applicant per calendar quarter.

G. Class VII, 72-Hour Liquor License: A license for selling liquor by:
4

1. A Nonprofit Club or Club which otherwise does not hold a liquor license; or

2. A currently licensed for profit business or other for profit or nonprofit entity
which desires to sell liquor outside of its licensed premises.

3. This license shall be subject to the following restrictions:
A. Shall not exceed two (2) consecutive calendar months; and
B. Shall not exceed two (2) events per calendar month.

1’
SEVERABILITY. If any provision of this ordinance or amendments thereto, or the application
to any person, thing or circumstance is held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the
validity or provisions or applications of the ordinance or amendments thereto which can be given
effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance
and amendments thereto are declared to be severable.

CONSTITUTIONALITY. If any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance shall be declared
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions of this ordinance
shall continue in full force and effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after passage,
approval, and publication as required by law, to wit, from and after the 6’ day of July, 2020.

Proposed on the day of , 2020.

Proposed by: Commissioner

__________________________

Adopted on the day of , 2020

Vote: Ayes: Commissioners:

Nays: Commissioners:

Nye County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nye County Code Title 5 AMENDMENTS TO THE PROPOSED DRAFT
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Absent: Commissioners:

BY:

_________________

ATTEST:

_______________

John Koenig, Chairman Sandra L. Merlino
Nye County Board of Clerk and Ex-Officio
County Commissioners Clerk of the Board

Nye County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nye County Code Title 5 AMENDMENTS TO THE PROPOSED DRAFT
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Original Proposed Version of
Nye County Bill No. 2020-06

Proposed at the April 28, 2020
BOCC Meeting



BILL NO. 2020-06

NYE COUNTY ORDINANCE NO.

SUMMARY: A Bill proposing to amend Nye
County Code Title 5, titled Business
Licenses and Regulations, Chapter
5.04.060, titled Classes by
reclassifying and defining classes of
business licenses.

TITLE: A BILL PROPOSING TO AMEND NYE COUNTY CODE TITLE 5, TITLED
BUSINESS LICENSES AND REGULATIONS, CHAPTER 5.04.060, TITLED
CLASSES BY RECLASSIFYING AND DEFINING CLASSES OF BUSINESS
LICENSES, AND PROVIDING FOR THE SEVERABILITY,
CONSTITUTIONALITY AND EFFECTIVE DATE THEREOF; AND OTHER
MATTERS PROPERLY RELATING THERETO.

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.119, the Nyc County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to amend the Nyc County Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.3 50 the Nyc County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to regulate the sale of intoxicating liquors.

NOW, THEREFORE, pursuant to NRS 244.110, the Board of County Commissioners
of the County of Nyc, State of Nevada, does ordain:

NYE COUNTY CODE IS HEREBY AMENDED AS FOLLOWS, with Deletions shown in
strike-through, red font, and additions and modifications shown in underscored blue font:

5.04.060: CLASSES:

The following classes of licenses may be issued to qualified applicants therefor:

A. Packaged liquor license;

B. Retail hnnnr license;

C. Wholesale delivc’ liquor license;

D. Wholesale liquor license;

E. Special club license;
Nye County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nve County Code Title 5_PROPOSED DRAFT
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F. Beer, wine only (sold with meals);

(Ord. 101 § 6, 1983)

A. Class I, Packaged Liquor Sales Establishment: Any establishment selling liquor to
individuals in its original corked or unopened package for consumpton off premises and
includes convenience-liquor-grocery stores and other similar types ores.

B. Class II, Retail Liquor Sales Establishment - Bar: Any establi. t selling at retail liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises, and in a bar g. h may or may not
include a restaurant as an accessory use.

C. Class III, Special Club Liquor Sales Establishme y establishment dispensing liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises only which is estricted in use to members
and guest(s) accompanied by a member.

D. Class IV, Liquor manufacturer: Any establishmen anufactures liquor for sale to the
public which includes distilleries, win ties, cideries. eries and breweries.

E. Class V. Wholesale Dealer: Any pe licensed sell li as it is originally packaged
to retail liquor stores or to another lic d wh

F. Class VI, Special Event Liqu Licens cense which authorizes the licensee to sell,
serve, or give away alcoholic erages consumption only on the premises for which
the license is issued and only oi such t s specified on the license, but not to exceed
nine (9) consecutive caleiid ays. The license which must be approved by the Director
is limited to one ( 1) per a nt per calendar quarter.

SEVERABILITY. If any provision of this ordinance or amendments thereto, or the application
to any person, thing or circumstance is held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the
validity or provisions or applications of the ordinance or amendments thereto which can be given
effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance
and amendments thereto are declared to be severable.

CONSTITUTIONALITY. If any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance shall be declared
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions of this ordinance
shall continue in fill force and effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after passage.
approval, and publication as required by law, to wit, from and after the 6th day of July, 2020.

Proposed on the day of , 2020.

Proposed by: Commissioner

Nve County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nyc County Code Title 5 PROPOSED DRAFT
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Adonted on the

Vote: Ayes: Commissioners:

Nays: Commissioners:

Absent: Commissioners:

BY: ATTEST:
John Koenig, Chairman Sandra L. Merlino
Nye County Board of Clerk and Ex-Officio
County Commissioners Clerk of the Board

EFFECTIVE DATE: This Ordinance shall be in thU force and effect from and after passage,
approval, and publication as required by law, to wit, from and after the — day of

____________

2020.

PROPOSED on the day of , 2020.

PROPOSED by COMMISSIONER

___________

PASSED on the day of , 2020.

VOTE: AYES:

ABSTENTIONS:

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF THE COUNTY OF NYE, STATE
OF NEVADA

By:

_____________

John Koenig, Chair

ATTEST:

Nye County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nve County Code Title 5_PROPOSED DRAFT
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Sandra L. Merlino, Coun Cleric
and Ex Officio Clerk of the Board

This ordinance shall be in force and effect from and after the day of the
of the year 2020.

Nye Coun’ Bill No. 2020-06 Amendin2 Nye Counts’ Code Title 5 PROPOSED DRAFT
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BILL NO. 2020-06

NYE COUNTY ORDINANCE NO.

SUMMARY: A Bill proposing to amend Nye
County Code Title 5, titled Business
Licenses and Regulations, Chapter
5.04.060, titled Classes by
reclassifying and defining classes of
business licenses.

TITLE: A BILL PROPOSING TO AMEND NYE COUNTY CODE TITLE 5, TITLED
BUSINESS LICENSES AND REGULATIONS, CHAPTER 5.04.060, TITLED
CLASSES BY RECLASSIFYING AND DEFINING CLASSES OF BUSINESS
LICENSES, AND PROVIDING FOR THE SEVERABILITY,
CONSTITUTIONALITY AND EFFECTIVE DATE THEREOF; AND OTHER
MATTERS PROPERLY RELATING THERETO.

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.119, the Nye County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to amend the Nye County Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.3 50 the Nye County Board of Commissioners
(Board) is authorized to regulate the sale of intoxicating liquors.

NOW, THEREFORE, pursuant to NRS 244.110, the Board of County Commissioners
of the County of Nye, State of Nevada, does ordain:

NYE COUNTY CODE IS HEREBY AMENDED AS FOLLOWS, with Deletions shown in
strike-through, red font, and additions and modifications shown in underscored blue font:

5.04.060: CLASSES:

The following classes of licenses may be issued to qualified applicants therefor:

A. Class I, Packaged Liquor Sales Establishment: Any establishment selling liquor to
individuals in its original corked or unopened package for consumption off premises and
includes convenience-liquor-grocery stores and other similar types of stores.

B. Class II, Retail Liquor Sales Establishment - Bar: Any establishment selling at retail liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises, and in a bar setting, which may or may not
include a restaurant as an accessory use.

Nye County Bill No. 2020-06 Amending Nye County Code Title 5POPOSED DRAFT
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C. Class III, Special Club Liquor Sales Establishment: Any establishment dispensing liquor
by the drink for consumption on premises only, and which is restricted in use to members
and guest(s) accompanied by a member.

D. Class IV, Liquor manufacturer: Any establishment that manufactures liquor for sale to the
public which includes distilleries, wineries, cideries, meaderies and breweries.

E. Class V, Wholesale Dealer: Any person licensed to sell liquor as it is originally packaged
to retail liquor stores or to another licensed wholesaler.

F. Class VI, Special Event Liquor License: A license which authorizes the licensee to sell,
serve, or give away alcoholic beverages for consumption only on the premises for which
the license is issued and only for such time as specified on the license, but not to exceed
nine (9) consecutive calendar days. The license which must be appro by the Director
is limited to one (1) per applicant per calendar quarter.

SEVERABILITY. If any provision of this ordinance or amendments thereto, or the application
to any person, thing or circumstance is held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the
validity or provisions or applications of the ordinance or amendments thereto which can be given

effect without the invalid provisions or applications, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance
and amendments thereto are declared to be severable.%

CONSTITUTIONALITY. If any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance shall be declared
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions of this ordinance
shall continue in full force and effect.

EFFECTIVE DATE. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after passage,
approval, and publication as required by law, to wit, from and after the 6th day of July, 2020.

Proposed on the day of

_________________,

2020.

Proposed by: Commissi

Adopted on the 2020

Vote: Ayes:

Commissioners:

Absent:

BY:

ATTEST:

______________

Sandra L. Merlino
Clerk and Ex-Officio
Clerk of the Board

day of

Commissioners:

Commissioners:

John Koenig, Chairman
Nye County Board of
County Commissioners
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